Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

NOTICES OF EXEMPT RULEMAKING

The Administrative Procedure Act requires the Register publication of the rules adopted by the state’s agencies under an exemption
from all or part of the Administrative Procedure Act. Some of these rules are exempted by A.R.S. 88 41-1005 or 41-1057; other rules
are exempted by other statutes; rules of the Corporation Commission are exempt from Attorney General review pursuant to a court
decision as determined by the Corporation Commission.

NOTICE OF EXEMPT RULEMAKING

TITLE 9. HEALTH SERVICES

CHAPTER 1. DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH SERVICES
ADMINISTRATION

Editor’s Note: The following Notice of Exempt Rulemaking was reviewed per Executive Order 2012-03 as issued by Governor
Brewer. (See the text of the executive order on page 1845). The Governor’s Office authorized the notice to proceed through the
rulemaking process on May 18, 2012.

[=

I

[

[~

[

R13-112
PREAMBLE

Article, Part or Section Affected (as applicable) Rulemaking Action
R9-1-412 Amend

Citations to the agency’s statutory rulemaking authority to include the authorizing statute (general) and the imple-
menting statute (specific) and the statute or session law authorizing the exemption:
Authorizing statutes: A.R.S. 88 36-132(A)(1) and (17) and 36-136(F)

Implementing statutes: A.R.S. 88 36-405 and 36-406
Statute or session law authorizing the exemption: Laws 2011, Chapter 96, § 2

The effective date of the rule and the agency’s reason it selected the effective date:
October 1, 2013

The effective date provides regulated persons and the Arizona Department of Health Services (Department) with a
90-day period after the date the rules are adopted to implement the rules.

A list of all notices published in the Reaqister as specified in R9-1-409(A) that pertain to the record of the exempt

rulemaking:
Notice of Public Information: 19 A.A.R. 547, March 22, 2013

The agency’s contact person who can answer guestions about the rulemaking:
Name: Cara Christ, M.D., Assistant Director

Address: Arizona Department of Health Services
Division of Licensing Services
150 N. 18th Ave., Suite 510
Phoenix, AZ 85007-3248

Telephone: (602) 364-3064

Fax: (602) 364-4808

E-mail: Cara.Christ@azdhs.gov

or

Name: Thomas Salow, Manager

Address: Arizona Department of Health Services

Office of Administrative Counsel and Rules
1740 W. Adams, Suite 203
Phoenix, AZ 85007

Telephone: (602) 542-1020
Fax: (602) 364-1150

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1800 July 19, 2013




Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

6.

[~

[

[©

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

E-mail: Thomas.Salow@azdhs.gov

An agency’s justification and reason why a rule should be made. amended, repealed. or renumbered to include an

explanation about the rulemaking:
Avrizona Revised Statutes (A.R.S.) § 36-405 requires the Department to adopt rules to “establish minimum standards
and requirements for the construction, modification and licensure of health care institutions necessary to ensure pub-
lic health, safety and welfare.” The Department has implemented A.R.S. § 36-405 in Arizona Administrative Code
R9-1-412. The Department uses R9-1-412, which contains physical plant health and safety codes and standards as
incorporations by reference, when reviewing architectural plans and specifications for construction or modification of
health care institutions under A.R.S. § 36-406. Laws 2011, Ch. 96, § 1 requires the Department to adopt rules regard-
ing health care institutions that reduce monetary or regulatory costs on persons or individuals. The physical plant
health and safety codes and standards currently in rule are outdated and may conflict with more current codes used by
local jurisdictions, with which a health care institution must also comply. The Department is revising R9-1-412 to
reduce the number of incorporated physical plant health and safety codes and standards and update the remaining
physical plant health and safety codes and standards. These changes should reduce the regulatory burden on health
care institutions that are required to comply with R9-1-412 when undergoing construction or modification of the
health care institution’s physical plant. The Department received an exception from the Governor’s rulemaking mor-
atorium, established by Executive Order 2012-03, for this rulemaking. The rule conforms to current rulemaking for-
mat and style requirements of the Governor’s Regulatory Review Council and the Office of the Secretary of State.

A reference to any study relevant to the rule that the agency reviewed and either relied on or did not rely on in its
evaluation of or justification for the rule. where the public may obtain or review each study. all data underlying
each study. and any analysis of each study and other supporting material:

None

A showing of good cause why the rule is necessary to promote a statewide interest if the rulemaking will diminish a
previous grant of authority of a political subdivision of this state:
Not applicable

The summary of the economic. small business. and consumer impact. if applicable:
Not applicable

10. A description of any changes between the proposed rulemaking. including any supplemental proposed rulemaking.

and final rulemaking package. (if applicable):
Not applicable

11. Anagency’s summary of the public or stakeholder comments made about the rulemaking and the agency response

to the comments. if applicable:
Not applicable

12. Any other matters prescribed by statute that are applicable to the specific agency or to any specific rule or class of

rules. When applicable, matters shall include, but not be limited to:
a. Whether the rule requires a permit. whether a general permit is used and if not, the reasons why a general per-
mit is not used:
The rule does not require a permit.

b. Whether a federal law is applicable to the subject of the rule. whether the rule is more stringent than the fed-
eral law and if so. citation to the statutory authority to exceed the requirements of the federal law:
Not applicable

Whether a person submitted an analysis to the agency that compares the rule’s impact of the competitiveness
of business in this state to the impact on business in other states:
Not applicable

A list of any incorporated by reference material and its location in the rules:
None

o

14. Whether this rule previously made. amended. repealed or renumbered as an emergency rule. If so, the agency shall

15.

state where the text changed between the emergency and the exempt rulemaking packages:
The rule was not previously made, amended, repealed, or renumbered as an emergency rule.

The full text of the rules follows:

July 19, 2013 Page 1801 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

TITLE 9. HEALTH SERVICES

CHAPTER 1. DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH SERVICES
ADMINISTRATION

ARTICLE 4. CODES AND STANDARDS REFERENCED

R9-1-412. Physical Plant Health and Safety Codes and Standards

ARTICLE 4. CODES AND STANDARDS REFERENCED

R9-1-412. Physical Plant Health and Safety Codes and Standards
A. The following physical plant health and safety codes and standards are incorporated by reference as modified, are on file
with the Department, and include no future editions or amendments:

1.

2.

Guidelines for Design and Construction of Health Care Facilities (2010 ed.). published by the American Society for
Healthcare Engineering and available from The Facility Guidelines Institute at www.fgiguidelines.org;

The following National Fire Codes (2012). published by and available from the National Fire Protection Association,
1 Batterymarch Park., Quincy, MA 02269, and at www.nfpa.org/catalog:

a. NFPA70 National Electrical Code,

b. NFPA101 Life Safety Code, and

Cc. 2012 Supplements;

3. tnternational-Code-Ceuneil; International Building Code {2666} (2012), published by and available from the Interna-

tional Code Council, Inc., Publications, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at

www.iccsafe.org, with the following modifications:

Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]";

Section 101.2 is modified by deleting the “Exception”;

Sections 103.1 through 103.3 are deleted;

Sections 104.1 through $04-9-% 104.11.2 are deleted;

Sections 105.1 through 105.7 are deleted;

Sections 106.1 through 10865 106.3 are deleted;

Sections 107.1 through 3844 107.5 are deleted;

Sections 108.1 through 168-6 108.4 are deleted;

Sections 109.1 through 109.6 are deleted;

Sections 110.1 through 436-4 110.6 are deleted;

Sections 111.1 through 4343 111.4 are deleted,;

Sections 112.1 through 112.3 are deleted,;

Sections 113.1 through 443-4 113.3 are deleted;

Sections 114.1 through 434-3 114.4 are deleted;

Sections 115.1 through 445:5 115.3 are deleted;

. Sections 116.1 through 116.5 are deleted:

-g. Section 3401.3 is modified by deleting “International Residential Code,” “International Energy Conservation

Code.” and “International Property Maintenance Code”; and

&r. Appendices A, B, C, D, ard-G K, L, and M are deleted,;
Socti L ol loting “of | : SDICTIONE:

POS3I—RmRTTSQ@mean o

o ; 4 - .

b : o B :

€ i - -

& i - -

e Seetions106-1through-106-53are-deleted;
£ i - -

& - 7

b i - - :

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1802 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

34.

|

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

International-Cede-Counell; International Mechanical Code {2806} (2012), published by and available from the Inter-
national Code Council, Inc., Publications, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at
www.iccsafe.org, with the following modifications:

a. Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]”,

b. Sections 103.1 through 103.4 are deleted,

c. Sections 104.1 through 464-8 104.7 are deleted,

d. Sections 105.1 through 105.4 are deleted,

&-e. Sections 106.1 through 106.5.3 are deleted,

ef. Sections 107.1 through 1674 107.6 are deleted,

fg. Sections 108.1 through 108.7.3 are deleted,

&h. Sections 109.1 through 109.7 are deleted, and

i Sections 110.1 through 110.4 are deleted. and

B Appendlx B is deleted

o i i o .
b- i - -

€ i - -

e i - -

e i - -

£ Sections1081through-108-5-are-deleted;
& - -

h- i - -

'S i - -

o -

International Plumbing Code (2012). published by and available from the International Code Council, Inc., Publica-
tions, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at www.iccsafe.org, with the following
modifications:

Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]”,

Sections 103.1 through 103.4 are deleted,

Sections 104.1 through 104.7 are deleted,

Sections 105.1 through 105.4 are deleted,

Sections 106.1 through 106.6.3 are deleted.,

Sections 107.1 through 107.7 are deleted,

Sections 108.1 through 108.7.3 are deleted,

Sections 109.1 through 109.7 are deleted,

Sections 110.1 through 110.4 are deleted, and

Appendix A is deleted:;

e e ee o

6. l-n{emaﬂenal—eeeleeeeneﬂ— International Fire Code (20806} (2012), published by and available from the International

Code Council, Inc., Publications, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at
www.iccsafe.org, With the following modifications:

Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]”,
Sections 103.1 through 103.4.1 are deleted,

Sections 104.1 through 104.11.3 are deleted,

Sections 105.1 through 305743 105.7.16 are deleted,

Sections 106.1 through 106.4 are deleted,

Sections 108.1 through 108.3 are deleted,

Sections 109.1 through $69-3-% 109.4.1 are deleted,

Sections 110.1 through 110.4 are deleted,

Sections 111.1 through 111.4 are deleted, and

Section 112.1 is deleted.,

Sections 113.1.through 113.5 are deleted, and

Appendlx Ais deleted

a.
b.
c.
d.
e.
f.
g.
h.
i
L
k.
i

July 19, 2013 Page 1803 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

FTTFR TP RO

o . oy o .

b i - -

& i - -

& Seetions106-1through-106-43-are-deleted;
e i - -

£ i - 7

§.

}&7+n{emaﬂenal—eede—eeuﬂeﬂ—%b—Ne—leeﬁANSl—A+H—l—2993 ICC/A117.1-2009, American National Standard:
Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities {2603} (2009), published by and available from the International
Code Council, Inc., Publications, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at

WWW. |ccsafe org;

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1804 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

b- 3 : 3
8. International Fuel Gas Code (2012). DUb|IShed by and avallable from the Internatlonal Code Councn Inc Publlca-
tions, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at www.iccsafe.org. with the following
modifications:
a.  Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]”,
b. Section 101.2 is modified by deleting the “Exception”,
c. Sections 103.1 through 103.4 are deleted,
d. Sections 104.1 through 104.7 are deleted,
e. Sections 105.1 through 105.5 are deleted,
f. Sections 106.1 through 106.6.3 are deleted,
g. Sections 107.1 through 107.6 are deleted,
h. Sections 108.1 through 108.7.3 are deleted,
i. Sections 109.1 through 109.7 are deleted, and
J.  Sections 110.1 through 110.4 are deleted: and
9. International Private Sewage Disposal Code (2012), published by and available from the International Code Council,

Inc., Publications, 4051 W. Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795, and at www.iccsafe.org. with the

following modifications:

Section 101.1 is modified by deleting “of [NAME OF JURISDICTION]”,

Sections 103.1 through 103.4 are deleted,

Sections 104.1 through 104.7 are deleted.,

Sections 105.1 through 105.4 are deleted,

Sections 106.1 through 106.4.3 are deleted,

Sections 107.1 through 107.7 are deleted.,

Sections 108.1 through 108.7.2 are deleted,

Sections 109.1 through 109.7 are deleted, and

Sections 110.1 through 110.4 are deleted.

B. The Department shall not assess any penalty or fee specified in the physical plant health and safety codes and standards
that are incorporated by reference in this Section.

NOTICE OF EXEMPT RULEMAKING

TITLE 9. HEALTH SERVICES

S e e ele o

CHAPTER 16. DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH SERVICES
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSING

Editor’s Note: The following Notice of Exempt Rulemaking was reviewed per Executive Order 2012-03 as issued by Governor
Brewer. (See the text of the executive order on page 1845). The Governor’s Office authorized the notice to proceed through the
rulemaking process on August 16, 2012.

[R13-113]
PREAMBLE
1. Article. Part or Sections Affected (as applicable) Rulemaking Action
R9-16-101 Amend
R9-16-102 Repeal
R9-16-102 Renumber
R9-16-102 Amend
R9-16-103 Renumber
R9-16-103 New Section
Exhibit B Repeal
Exhibit C Repeal
R9-16-104 Repeal
R9-16-104 New Section

July 19, 2013 Page 1805 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

I

[«

[~

[

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

R9-16-105 Amend
Exhibit D Repeal
R9-16-105.01 Repeal
Table 1 Repeal
R9-16-106 Renumber
R9-16-106 New Section
R9-16-107 Renumber
R9-16-107 New Section
Table 1.1 New Section
Exhibit E Repeal
R9-16-108 Renumber
R9-16-108 Amend
R9-16-109 Renumber
R9-16-109 New Section
R9-16-110 Renumber
R9-16-110 New Section
R9-16-111 Renumber
R9-16-111 Amend
R9-16-112 Renumber
R9-16-112 Amend
R9-16-113 Renumber
R9-16-113 Amend
R9-16-114 New Section
R9-16-115 Renumber
R9-16-115 Amend
R9-16-116 Renumber
R9-16-116 Amend
R9-16-117 New Section

Citations to the agency’s statutory rulemaking authority to include the authorizing statute (general) and the imple-
menting statute (specific) and the statute or session law authorizing the exemption:
Authorizing statutes: A.R.S. §§ 36-132(A)(1) and 36-136(F)

Implementing statutes: A.R.S. 88§ 36-751 et seq.
Statute or session law authorizing the exemption: Laws 2012, Chapter 93

The effective date of the rule and the agency’s reason it selected the effective date:
July 1, 2013

The effective date is the earliest date the new rules can become effective consistent with opportunities for stakeholder
involvement, requirements for public notice, and opportunity for public comment in Laws 2012, Chapter 93.

A list of all notices published in the Reaqister as specified in R9-1-409(A) that pertain to the record of the exempt

rulemaking:
Notice of Public Information: 19 A.A.R. 994, May 10, 2013

The agency’s contact person who can answer guestions about the rulemaking:
Name: Cara Christ, M.D., Assistant Director

Address: Arizona Department of Health Services
Division of Licensing Services
150 N. 18th Ave., Suite 510
Phoenix, AZ 85007

Telephone: (602) 364-3064

Fax: (602) 364-4808

E-mail: Cara.Christ@azdhs.gov

or

Name: Thomas Salow, Manager

Address: Arizona Department of Health Services
Office of Administrative Counsel and Rules
1740 W. Adams, Suite 203
Phoenix, AZ 85007

Telephone: (602) 542-1020

Volume 19, Issue 29

Page 1806

July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

6.

I~

[

[©

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Fax: (602) 364-1150
E-mail: Thomas.Salow@azdhs.gov

An agency’s justification and reason why a rule should be made. amended, repealed. or renumbered to include an

explanation about the rulemaking:
The statutes in Arizona Revised Statutes (A.R.S.) Title 36, Chapter 6, Article 7, govern licensing and regulation of
midwifery. Under these statutes, the Department adopted the rules in 9 A.A.C. 16, Article 1. Laws 2012, Chapter 93
requires the Department to consider adopting rules regarding midwifery that reduce the regulatory burden on licensed
midwives, revise the midwifery scope of practice, and if available, adopt national licensure testing standards. To
facilitate these changes, Laws 2012, Chapter 93 gives the Department exempt rulemaking authority until July 1, 2013
to amend 9 A.A.C. 16, Article 1. The Department received an exception from the Governor’s rulemaking morato-
rium, established by Executive Order 2012-03, for this rulemaking.

The amendments to 9 A.A.C. 16 made under Laws 2012, Chapter 93 include definition changes to improve clarity
and the streamlining and updating of sections pertaining to applicant qualifications, application requirements, prohib-
ited practice and transfer of care, required consultation, emergency measures, and administration of client and new-
born records.

Notable changes to 9 A.A.C. 16 include:

» The elimination of Department-administered examination requirements and the addition of conditions for an
applicant to provide documentation of certification by the North American Registry of Midwives (NARM)
as a Certified Professional Midwife (CPM);

» The expansion of a midwife’s scope of practice where a client may be accepted for a vaginal delivery after
Caesarean section or for the delivery a fetus in a complete or frank breech presentation;

»  The requirement that a midwife must establish an emergency care plan for all clients;

* Anew section regarding informed consent for midwifery services;

* A new section permitting a client to decline testing;

»  The establishment of a midwifery advisory committee to assist the director of the Department in analysis
and research and the formulation of an annual report with recommendations to the Department; and

» The elimination of the exhibits pertaining to initial and renewal application forms, the preceptor rating
guide, the affidavit of continuing education, and the midwives quarterly report.

All changes conform to current rulemaking format and style requirements of the Governor’s Regulatory Review
Council and the Office of the Secretary of State.

A reference to any study relevant to the rule that the agency reviewed and either relied on or did not rely on in its
evaluation of or justification for the rule. where the public may obtain or review each study. all data underlying
each study. and any analysis of each study and other supporting material:

None

A showing of good cause why the rule is necessary to promote a statewide interest if the rulemaking will diminish a
previous grant of authority of a political subdivision of this state:
Not applicable

The summary of the economic. small business. and consumer impact. if applicable:
Not applicable

10. A description of any changes between the proposed rulemaking. including any supplemental proposed rulemaking.

and final rulemaking package. (if applicable):
Not applicable

11. Anagency’s summary of the public or stakeholder comments made about the rulemaking and the agency response

to the comments. if applicable:
Not applicable

12. Any other matters prescribed by statute that are applicable to the specific agency or to any specific rule or class of

rules. When applicable, matters shall include, but not be limited to:
a. Whether the rule requires a permit. whether a general permit is used and if not, the reasons why a general per-
mit is not used:
A.R.S. § 36-405 authorizes the Department to issue licenses to specific applicants based on specific circum-
stances, so a general permit is not appropriate and is not used.

b. Whether a federal law is applicable to the subject of the rule. whether the rule is more stringent than the fed-
eral law and if so. citation to the statutory authority to exceed the requirements of the federal law:
Not applicable

c. Whether a person submitted an analysis to the agency that compares the rule’s impact of the competitiveness

July 19, 2013 Page 1807 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

of business in this state to the impact on business in other states:
Not applicable

13. A list of any incorporated by reference material and its location in the rules:
None

14. Whether this rule previously made. amended. repealed or renumbered as an emergency rule. If so, the agency shall
state where the text changed between the emergency and the exempt rulemaking packages:
The rule was not previously made, amended, repealed, or renumbered as an emergency rule.

15. The full text of the rules follows:

TITLE 9. HEALTH SERVICES

CHAPTER 16. DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH SERVICES
OCCUPATIONAL LICENSING

ARTICLE 1. LICENSING OF MIDWIFERY

Sections
R9-16-101. Definitions
16 . Sualifieations for Li
R9-16-103- R9-16-102. Application for Initial Licensure
R9-16-103. Renewal

Exhibit B.  Midwife-License-ApplicationFerm Repealed
Exhibit C.  PreceptorRating-Guide Repealed
R9-16-104.  Administration
R9-16-105.  tnitialieenseFee;Renewal: Continuing Education
Exhibit D. Renewal-Applicationerm Repealed
R9-16-105.01. Fime-frames Repealed
Table 1. Fime-frames Repealed
R9-16-106.  Name Change; Duplicate License
R9-16-107.  Time-frames
Table1.1.  Time-frames (in calendar days)
ExhibitE.  {ndividual-QuarterlyRepert Repealed
R9-19-106- R9-16-108. Responsibilities of the-icensed a Midwife; Scope of Practice
R9-16-109.  Informed Consent for Midwifery Services
R9-16-110.  Assertion to Decline Required Tests
R9-16-108- R9-16-111. Prohibited Practice; Transfer of Care
R9-16-112: i
R9-16-109- R9-16-112. Required Consultation
R9-16-110- R9-16-113. Emergency Serviees Measures
R9-16-114. Midwife Report after Termination of Midwifery Services
R9-16-107- R9-16-115. Recordkeeping-and-ReportReguirements Client and Newborn Records
R9-16-111- R9-16-116. Denial, Suspension, or Revocation of License; Civil Penalties; Procedures
R9-16-117.  Midwifery Advisory Committee

ARTICLE 1. LICENSING OF MIDWIFERY

R9-16-101. Definitions
iele 1 unl | I . iros:
1__ % 1 mea 1

P gheP

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1808 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

B OBE BEBE RE gE B eS8

B

BRE B

RE BBX

B & 8% £8F F 8B

July 19, 2013 Page 1809 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

of State-
In addition to the definitions in A.R.S. § 36-751, the following definitions apply in this Article unless otherwise specified:

= =
Fle

—
N

= = =
=

= =
~ |

= =
© |

)
©

N
—

“Abnormal presentation” means the fetus is not in a head-down position with the crown of the head being the leading
body part.

“Addiction” means a condition that results when a person ingests a substance that becomes compulsive and interferes
with ordinary life responsibilities, such as work., relationships, or health.

“Amniotic” means the fluid surrounding the fetus while in the mother's uterus.

“Apgar score” means the number indicating a newborn’s physical condition attained by rating selected body func-
tions.

“Aseptic” means free of germs.

“Breech” means a complete breech, a frank breech, or an incomplete breech.

“Certified nurse midwife” means an individual who meets the criteria in 4 A.A.C. 19, Article 5 and is certified by the
Arizona State Board of Nursing.

“Complete breech” means that at the time of birth the buttocks of a fetus is pointing downward with both legs folded
at the knees and the feet near the buttocks.

“Calendar day” means each day. not including the day of the act, event, or default from which a designated period of
time begins to run, but including the last day of the period unless it is a Saturday, Sunday, statewide furlough day. or
legal holiday, in which case the period runs until the end of the next day that is not a Saturday, Sunday, statewide fur-
lough day, or legal holiday.

“Cervix” means the narrow lower end of the uterus which protrudes into the cavity of the vagina.

“Consultation” means communication between a midwife and a physician or a midwife and a certified nurse midwife
for the purpose of receiving a written or verbal recommendation and implementing prospective advice regarding the
care of a pregnant woman or the woman’s child.

. “Current photograph” means an image of an individual, taken no more than 60 calendar days before the submission

of the individual's application, in a Department-approved electronic format capable of producing an image that:

Has a resolution of at least 600 x 600 pixels but not more than 1200 x 1200 pixels;

Is 2 inches by 2 inches in size;

Is in natural color;

Is a front view of the individual's full face, without a hat or headgear that obscures the hair or hairline;

Has a plain white or off-white background: and

. Has between 1 and 1 3/8 inches from the bottom of the chin to the top of the head.

Dilation” means opening of the cervix during the mechanism of labor to allow for passage of the fetus.
“Effacement” means the gradual thinning of the cervix during the mechanism of labor and indicates progress in labor.
“Emergency care plan” means the arrangements established by a midwife for a client’s transfer of care in a situation
in which the health or safety of the client or newborn are determined to be at risk.

“Emergency medical services provider” has the same meaning as in A.R.S. § 36-2201.

“Episiotomy” means the cutting of the perineum, center, middle, or midline, in order to enlarge the vaginal opening
for delivery.

“Fetus” means a child in utero from conception to birth.

“Frank breech” means that at the time of birth the buttocks of a fetus is pointing downward with both legs folded flat
up against the head.

“Gestation” means the length of time from conception to birth, as calculated from the first day of the last normal men-

strual period.

P20 [

21. “Gravida” means the number of times the mother has been pregnant, including a current pregnancy, regardless of

N
N

whether these pregnancies were carried to term.

22. “Incomplete breech” means that at the time of birth the buttocks of a fetus is pointing downward with one leg folded

N N
N

N [N
o |1

at the knee with the foot near the buttocks.

“Infant” has the same meaning as in A.R.S. § 36-694.

“Informed consent” means a document signed by a client, as provided in R9-16-109, agreeing to the provision of
midwifery services.

“Intrapartum” means occurring from the onset of labor until after the delivery of the placenta.

“Jurisprudence test” means an assessment of an individual’s knowledge of the:

a. Laws of this state concerning the reporting of births, prenatal blood tests, and newborn screening; and

b. Rules pertaining to the practice of midwifery.

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1810 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

27. “Ketones” means certain harmful chemical elements which are present in the body in excessive amounts when there
is a compromised bodily function.

28. “Local registrar” means a person appointed by the state's registrar of vital statistics for a registration district whose
duty includes receipt of birth and death certificates for births and deaths occurring within that district for review, reg-
istration, and transmittal to the state office of vital records according to A.R.S. Title 36, Chapter 3.

29. “Meconium” means the first bowel movement of the newborn. which is greenish black in color and tarry in consis-

tency.

30. “Midwifery services” means health care, provided by a midwife to a mother, related to pregnancy, labor, delivery or
postpartum care.

31. “Newborn” has the same meaning as in A.R.S. 8§ 36-694.

32. “Para” means the number of births that are greater than 20 weeks of gestation, including viable and non-viable births,
where multiples are counted as one birth.

33. “Parity” means the number of newborns a woman has delivered.

34. “Perineum” means the muscular region in the female between the vaginal opening and the anus.

35. “Physician” means an allopathic, an osteopathic, or a naturopathic practitioner licensed according to A.R.S. Title 32,
Chapters 13, 14, or 17.

36. “Postpartum” means the six-week period following delivery of a newborn and placenta.

37. “Prenatal” means the period from conception to the onset of labor and birth.

38. “Prenatal care” means the on-going risk assessments, clinical examinations, and prenatal, nutritional, and anticipatory
guidance offered to a pregnant woman.

39. “Prenatal visit” means each clinical examination of a pregnant woman for the purpose of monitoring the course of
gestation and the overall health of the woman.

40. “Primigravida” means a woman who is pregnant for the first time.

41. “Primipara” means a woman who has given birth to her first newborn.

42. “Quickening” means the first perceptible movement of the fetus in the uterus, occurring usually in the 16th to the
20th week of gestation.

43. “Rh” means a blood antigen.

44. “Serious mental illness” means a condition in an individual who is 18 years of age or older and who exhibits emo-
tional or behavioral functioning, as a result of a mental disorder as defined in A.R.S. § 36-501, that:

a. s severe and persistent, resulting in a long-term limitation of their functional capacities for primary activities of
daily living such as interpersonal relationships, homemaking, self-care, employment and recreation; and

b. Impairs or substantially interferes with the capacity of the individual to remain in the community without sup-
portive treatment or services of a long-term or indefinite duration.

45. “Substance abuse” means the continued use of alcohol or other drugs in spite of negative consequences.

46. “Shoulder dystocia” means the shoulders of the fetus are wedged in the mother's pelvis in such a way that the fetus is
unable to be born without emergency action.

47. “Transfer of care” means that a midwife refers the care of a client or newborn to an emergency medical services pro-
vider, a certified nurse midwife, a hospital, or a physician who then assumes responsibility for the direct care of the
client or newborn.

48. “Working day” means a Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday, Thursday, or Friday that is not a state holiday or a statewide
furlough day.

RO-16-102-

- Repealed

N OPyREPPF

July 19, 2013 Page 1811 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

D
A
1. Anapplication in a format provided by the Department that contains:
a. The applicant's name, address, telephone number, and e-mail address;
b. The applicant’s Social Security Number, as required under A.R.S. 88 25-320 and 25-502;
c. Whether the applicant has ever been convicted of a felony or a misdemeanor in this or another state or jurisdic-
tion;
d. If the applicant was convicted of a felony or misdemeanor:
i. The date of the conviction,
ii. The state or jurisdiction of the conviction,
iii. An explanation of the crime of which the applicant was convicted, and
iv. The disposition of the case;
e. Whether the applicant agrees to allow the Department to submit supplemental requests for information under R9-
16-107(C)(2):
f. An attestation that information required as part of the application has been submitted and is true and accurate;
and
9. The applicant’s signature and date of signature;
2. A copy of the applicant’s:
a. U.S. passport, current or expired:;
b. Birth certificate;
c. Naturalization documents; or
d. Documentation of legal resident alien status;
3. Documentation that demonstrates the applicant is 21 years of age or older if the documentation submitted in subsec-

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1812 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

m

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

tion (A)(2) does not demonstrate that the applicant is 21 years of age or older:

4. Current documentation of completion of training in:
a. Adult basic cardiopulmonary resuscitation through a course recognized by the American Heart Association, and
b. Neonatal resuscitation through a course recognized by the American Academy of Pediatrics or American Heart

Association;

5. Documentation of a high school diploma, a high school equivalency diploma, an associate degree, or a higher degree;

6. Documentation that the applicant is certified by the North American Registry of Midwives as a Certified Professional
Midwife;

7. A current photograph of the applicant:

8. A non-refundable application fee of $25; and

9. A non-refundable testing fee of $100 for a jurisprudence test administered by the Department.

The Department shall review an application for an initial license to practice midwifery according to R9-16-107 and Table

1.1.

If an applicant receives notification of eligibility to take the jurisprudence test, the applicant:

1. Shall take the jurisprudence test administered by the Department,

2. Shall provide proof of identity by a government-issued photographic identification card upon the request of the indi-

vidual administering the jurisprudence test,

May take the jurisprudence test as many times as desired without paying an additional testing fee, and

Shall score 80% or higher correct answers on the jurisprudence test to be eligible to receive an initial license to prac-

tice midwifery.

If an applicant scores 80% or higher correct answers on the jurisprudence test, the Department shall provide written notice

to the applicant, within five working days after the date of the jurisprudence test, to submit to the Department:

1. Alicensing fee of $25; and

2. The documentation required in subsection (A)(4) or (6). if the training required in subsection(A)(4) or certification
required in subsection (A)(6) is not current.

The Department shall issue an initial license to practice midwifery within five working days after receiving the applicable

documentation and licensing fee required in subsection (D).

The Department shall provide to an applicant a written notice of denial that complies with A.R.S. § 41-1092.03(A) and

inform the applicant that the applicant may reapply under subsection (A) if the applicant does not:

1. Score 80% or higher correct answers on the jurisprudence test within 180 calendar days after the date of the notifica-
tion of eligibility to take the jurisprudence test, or

2. Submit to the Department the applicable documentation and licensing fee required in subsection (D) within 120 cal-
endar days after the date of the notification in subsection (D).

bl

R9-16-103. Renewal

A.

At least 30 calendar days and no more than 60 calendar days before the expiration date of a midwifery license, a midwife
shall submit to the Department:

1. An application for renewal of a midwifery license in a format provided by the Department, that contains:

The midwife's name, address, telephone number, and e-mail address;

The midwife’s license number;

Whether the midwife has been convicted of a felony or a misdemeanor in this or another state or jurisdiction in
the previous two years;

If the midwife was convicted of a felony or misdemeanor:

i. The date of the conviction,

ii. The state or jurisdiction of the conviction,

iii. An explanation of the crime of which the midwife was convicted, and

iv. The disposition of the case;

Whether the midwife agrees to allow the Department to submit supplemental requests for information under R9-

16-107(C)(2):

An attestation that the midwife has completed the continuing education requirement in R9-16-105;

An attestation that the midwife is complying with the requirements in A.R.S. § 32-3211;

An attestation that information required as part of the application has been submitted and is true and accurate;

and

i. The midwife’s signature and date of signature;

Either:

a. Documentation that the midwife is currently certified by the North American Registry of Midwives as a Certified
Professional Midwife; or

b. For a midwife who has been continuously licensed as a midwife by the Department since 1999, a copy of both
sides of documentation showing the completion of current training in:
i.  Adult basic cardiopulmonary resuscitation that meets the requirements in R9-16-102(A)(4)(a), and

o = |

=

|®

== =

N>

July 19, 2013 Page 1813 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

ii. Neonatal resuscitation that meets the requirements in R9-16-102(A)(4)(b): and
3. A non-refundable renewal fee of $25.
B. The Department shall review an application for renewal of a license to practice midwifery according to R9-16-107 and
Table 1.

EXHHBH-BMIBWYWHFEHCGENSEARPHICATHON-FORM REPEALED

Name Date
Date-Stamp Name Date
Date of Birt
Date-of Birth
FJ-Dates Address
Address

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1814 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Data-
Tt

Nama:
TNTHC

Addrace:
~GOrESST

Hama Dhana-
TTOTHC T T1OTCS
\Work Phona-
vV Ok T Homcs

Soecial-Seeuritv#
SUCTA-Stourtty 1t

Pracantar Nlama © Titla-
FTIECCPtorTNarit &1t

Work Addrecs:
vV OTIKAGOTCSST

Addrace:
AGOHESST

BEXHHBH-GPRECEPTFORRAHNG GUHBE REPEALED

Volume 19, Issue 29

Page 1815

July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

R9-16-104. Administration
A. A midwife may submit a written request for the Department to:
1. Add the midwife’s name, address. and telephone number to a list of licensed midwives on the Department’s website;
or
2. Remove the midwife’s name, address, and telephone number from a list of licensed midwives on the Department’s
website.
B. A midwife shall:
1. Notify the Department in a format provided by the Department within five working days after:
a. A client has died while under the midwife’s care,
b. A stillborn child has been delivered by the midwife, or
c. A newborn delivered by the midwife has died within the first 6 weeks after birth; and
2. Provide a summary of the:
a. Circumstances leading up to the event, and
b. Actions taken by the midwife in response to the event.
C. A midwife shall:
1. Maintain documentation of:
a. Completion of current training in:
i.  Adult basic cardiopulmonary resuscitation that meets the requirements in R9-16-102(A)(4)(a), and
ii. Neonatal resuscitation that meets the requirements in R9-16-102(A)(4)(b):
b. Exceptas provided in R9-16-103(A)(2)(b). current certification as a Certified Professional Midwife by the North
American Reqistry of Midwives: and
c. The continuing education required in subsection R9-16-105 for at least the previous three years; and
2. Provide a copy of documentation required in subsection (C)(1) to the Department within 2 working days after the
Department’s request.

R9-16-105. l-n-l-t-ral—l:feeﬂee-Fee—Reﬂewa-l— Continuing Educatlon

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1816 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

During the term of a midwifery license, the midwife shall obtain at least 20 continuing education units that:
1. Improve the midwife’s ability to:
Provide services within the midwife’s scope of practice,

Recognize and respond to situations outside the midwife’s scope of practice, or

Provide guidance to other services a client may need; and
ave been approved as applicable to the practice of midwifery by the:

American Nurses Association,

American Congress of Obstetrics and Gynecologists,

Midwives Alliance of North America,

Arizona Medical Association,

American College of Nurse Midwives,

Midwifery Education Accreditation Council, or

Another health professional organization.

N>

QP e TR | Te [T

ExHHBH-B-RENEWALARPHCAHON-FORM REPEALED

July 19, 2013 Page 1817 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Sianatyra:

Stgratare:

July 19, 2013

Nata of Annlication
DotC- O pphtation

for
Page 1818

1f viac wwhat athar linancac da var haldo
Y ES vttt OtHE T eSS G0y ounor

Nao
™O

Haocnitale:
TTOSPItarS:
Dhycieiane:
iy SiCans:
Othar-
CHHCH

TS

Sianatyra-
Stgratarc:

EN
2
3

Volume 19, Issue 29

Annheation-returned-on
APPHCAtOTCtoeaon



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Annlication-Reviawad hy

PRt O CVvICYv a1y

Effactivia Data af | 1concn

CHECUVvEC Dot O =1Ce st

My commission-axniras:
Ty COmMSSIOnCXpPITeS:

Volume 19, Issue 29

Page 1819

July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1820 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

License Renewal | 36-754
{R9-16-105)

R9-16-106. Name Change; Duplicate License
A. To request a name change on a midwifery license or a duplicate midwifery license, a midwife shall submit in writing to

" the Department:

1. The midwife’s name on the current midwifery license:
2. If applicable, the midwife’s new name;
3. The midwife’s address. license number, and e-mail address;
4. As applicable:
a. Documentation supporting the midwife’s name change. or
b. A statement that the midwife is requesting a duplicate midwifery license; and
5. A non-refundable fee of $10.00.

Upon receipt of the written request required in subsection (A), the Department shall issue, as applicable:

1. An amended midwifery license that incorporates the name change but retains the expiration date of the midwifery
license, or

2. A duplicate midwifery license.

|

July 19, 2013 Page 1821 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

R9-16-107. Time-frames

A. The overall time-frame described in A.R.S. 8 41-1072(2) for each type of license granted by the Department is specified

in Table 1.1. The applicant or midwife and the Department may agree in writing to extend the substantive review time-

frame and the overall time-frame. The substantive review time-frame and the overall time-frame may not be extended by

more than 25 percent of the overall time-frame.

|

The administrative completeness review time-frame described in A.R.S. § 41-1072(1) for each type of license granted by

the Department is specified in Table 1.1.

1.

N>

3.

4.
5.

6.

1o

The administrative completeness review time-frame begins:

a. For an applicant submitting an application for initial licensure, when the Department receives the application
packet required in R9-16-102(A): and

b. For a licensed midwife applying to renew a midwifery license, when the Department receives the application
packet required in R9-16-103(A).

If an application is incomplete, the Department shall provide a notice of deficiencies to the applicant or midwife

describing the missing documentation or incomplete information. The administrative completeness review time-

frame and the overall time-frame are suspended from the date of the notice until the date the Department receives the

documentation or information listed in the notice of deficiencies. An applicant or midwife shall submit to the Depart-

ment the documentation or information listed in the notice of deficiencies within the time specified in Table 1.1 for

responding to a notice of deficiencies.

If the applicant or midwife submits the documentation or information listed in the notice of deficiencies within the

time specified in Table 1.1, the Department shall provide a written notice of administrative completeness to the appli-

cant or midwife.

If the applicant or midwife does not submit the documentation or information listed in the notice of deficiencies

within the time specified in Table 1.1, the Department shall consider the application withdrawn.

When an application is complete the Department shall provide a notice of administrative completeness to the appli-

cant or midwife.

If the Department issues a notice of eligibility to take the jurisprudence test or a license during the administrative

completeness review time-frame, the Department shall not issue a separate written notice of administrative complete-

ness.

The substantive review time-frame described in A.R.S. 8 41-1072(3) is specified in Table 1.1 and begins on the date of the

notice of administrative completeness.

1.

2.

|«

[~

|

If an application complies with the requirements in this Article and A.R.S. Title 36, Chapter 6, Article 7, the Depart-
ment shall issue a notice of eligibility to take the jurisprudence test to an applicant or a license to a midwife.

If an application does not comply with the requirements in this Article or A.R.S. Title 36, Chapter 6, Article 7, the
Department shall make one comprehensive written request for additional information. unless the applicant or mid-
wife has agreed in writing to allow the Department to submit supplemental requests for information. The substantive
review time-frame and the overall time-frame are suspended from the date that the Department sends a comprehen-
sive written request for additional information or a supplemental request for information until the date that the
Department receives all of the information requested.

An applicant or midwife shall submit to the Department all of the information requested in a comprehensive written
request for additional information or a supplemental request for information within the time specified in Table 1.1.

If the applicant or midwife does not submit the additional information within the time specified in Table 1.1 or the
additional information submitted by the applicant or midwife does not demonstrate compliance with this Article and
A.R.S. Title 36, Chapter 6. Article 7, the Department shall provide to the applicant a written notice of denial that
complies with A.R.S. § 41-1092.03(A).

If the applicant or midwife submits the additional information within the time specified in Table 1.1 and the addi-
tional information submitted by the applicant or midwife demonstrates compliance with this Article and A.R.S. Title
36, Chapter 6, Article 7, the Department shall issue a notice of eligibility to take the jurisprudence test to an applicant
or a license to a midwife.

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1822 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Table 1.1. Time-frames (in calendar days)
Type of Approval [Statutory Overall Administrative Time to Substantive [Time to Respond to
Authority Time- Completeness Respond to  |Review Time- |Comprehensive
Frame Review Time- Notice of Frame Written Request
Frame Deficiency
Eliqgibility for A.R.S. 88 36- [30 15 60 15 30
Jurisprudence Test |753., 36-754,
(R9-16-102) and 36-755
Midwifery License [A.R.S.§36- |30 15 30 15 15
Renewal 754
(R9-16-103)
BEXHBHEINBPAHB YA QUARTFEREY-REPORTF REPEALED
ARIZONA-BERARTFMENTOFHEALTFH-SERACES
SR CE O MATERNAEAND-CHHD-HEALTH
MBWAES QUARTFEREY-REPORF
MHBWHFE
. 22—t
LICNO- OFR—¥YR
REPORTPREPAREDBY— DATE
3. PAHENT
EAST FRST MAIDEN
4 B6eB H4 = A 5 HA & =t
MO- DAY YR- AGE PT.NO.
7 REGISTEREBD: & EbG 9. DELIVERED:
| | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
10. GRABA}—— 1 PARA-TERM:}—— PREMATURE}—— ABORTHONS:——} EMANGH——
%12 PREV. HOME BIRFH:YESING *13. REASON-FORCHOOSHNGH-B
ANTFERPARTUM: 14 NOMIDWHFEMYSIFS——— 15 NO—MEBICAL\ASITS
16. MEDICALVASITSBY: MD/DOJOTHER
17. DATESOFFIRSTANBEASTMEDICALASITS
18. FOTALWEIGHT-GAIN}——HBS:
FORMALARRANGEMENTFORMEDICAL BACK-UP:
19. PHYSICHAN: MB/DO20- HOSPIFAL
21 MIDWIFE-CARE-TERMINATED AT WKS-GEST 22. REASON
(ENTER CODENO-FROMBACK)
LABORATORY-DATA{MOSTRECENT)
Hemateerit 25 26- YalPretein 39-Pos/Neg 40

July 19, 2013 Page 1823 Volume 19, Issue 29




Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

*RubehaTFiter 20->1:10/<1:10 36- *YaiMicroscopic 43PosiNeg 44
Rh-Factor 31 PesiNeg 32 *G.CCulture 45PosiNeg 46
*Antibody TFiter 33PesiNeg 34 x 47 48
x 49. 56-

51 52

FHRDSTAGE 1+

: i 16-Date
—Repred—Organs B-10-Pre-eclampsia-Eclampsia B-13Pestpartum-hemorrhage/
B-5-Abn—Findingsen —transfusion
—Physical-Exam- B-14-Other B-Yes—B-Ne
ANFERPARTFUM CONSULFAHON
B-18FElevatedBR B-24-Bleeding-istor2nd B-29FlevatedFemp:
B-19-FEdema;Handslfaee —TFrimester B-3642\Wks—Cestation 37D
B-20Persistent-headaches B-25Bleeding3rd-Frim- B-31-FExeessive-vomiting
B2 isual-disturbanees 8269+ B-32Persistent-Ketonuria 38 Date
B-22-Seizures B2+-HEB<10-gmfer B-33-Wt-Gain<10th—atFerm
B-23Severe-Abdem-Pain —HETF<30% B-34—Shertressof Breath 39-Approved-forcontinued
B-28aricosities;wvatlegs B-35ChestPain —Mhdwife-eare:
B-36-Other B-¥es—H-Ne
FEFUS CONSULFAHON
B-40-Abr-Growth-Pattern B-44FHF<166 B-48Mecontum-Statring
B-41-FExpes—to-Teratogens B45FHF>166 B-49Multiple-Gestation 51D+
B-42ExeessiveActivity B-46—tregFHT B-50-0Other
B-43Deereased-Activity B-47-Cord—+Prolapse 52 Bate
53—-Approved-forcontinued
—B-Yes—BNe
Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1824 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

HINFRAPARTIHM CONSULFAHON
B-54Bleeding-tstor2nd-Stage B-62Prolonged-1stStage B-69-UterineAtony
B-55—FlevatedBR B-63Prolonged-2nd-Stage B-70\aceration 12 b+
B-56—FlevatedFemp: B-64Persistent-Ketenuria B-#\aceration2°
B-5+Pres—net-Vertex B-65-Difficutt-Delivery/Shoulder B-72taceration—3° 78bate
B-58-nengaged-Head —Dystecia B-73—+taceration 42
B-59Premature ROM B-66Hemorrhagetr-3rd-Stage-of B-7#4\acerationperturethral 79—Fime
B-60Prolonged-ROM —within24-hours B-75—Sheek
B-61-Premature-Laber B-6+RetainedPlacenta B-7#6-—0Other 80—-Approved-forcontinued
B-68Retained-fragmentsor —Mhdwife-eare:
—membranes —B-Yes—BNe

HNFANF CONSULFAHON
B-81-APCGAR<5@tMin: B-91Cengenttal-Anemaly B-101Jttterinessnotresehved
B-82-ARCGAR<7-@-5-Min: B-92Preterm —byfeeding 110D+
B-83Respiratery-Bistress B-93Pest-Ferm B-102-Abrermal-Femp:
B-84-02Given B-94—<2500-gmi5-H2bs: B-103-Abrfinding-enPE: 1 DBate
B-85-Assisted-entHation B-95—4500-gm/10bs: B-104-Neurinationir-24-heurs
B-86—Cardiac Massage B-96-SGA B-105-Ne-Meeontvmr24-hours H2Fime
B-87+Pale/Cyanetic/Gray B-97-1LGA B-106-AbdeminalBistention
B-88Mecontum-Stained B-98+lushediRed B-167Jaundice H3-Approved-forcontinuved
B-89-+euOder B-99-Abrermal-Cord B-108-Poeerteeding —Mhdwifeeare:
B-96-Abr—Head-Cire: B-100-Abrermal-Cry B-109-Other B-Yes—B-Ne
POSTFRARTUM CONSULFAHON
B-114-Hemorrhageafter24-hours B-H7-Unableto-Veidin6-hours B-120-Fhrombephlebitis
B-115-Subinvelution B-118-Yrinary Fractinf: —{pesitive Homan’ssign 123-bB+
B-116-Yterinetrfection B-119-Breastrfection B-121-Depression

B-122-Other 124 Date

125-Approved-forcontinued
—B-Yes—H

July 19, 2013 Page 1825

Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

RO-10-1066- R9-16-108. R

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1826 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

July 19, 2013 Page 1827 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

1

|©

Imim

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

A mldW|fe shaII Drowde mldW|ferv services only to a healthv woman, determlned through a DthmaI assessment and

review of the woman’s obstetrical history, whose expected outcome of pregnancy is most likely to be the delivery of a
healthy newborn and an intact placenta.

Except as provided in R9-16-111(C) or (D), a midwife who is certified by the North American Registry of Midwives as a
Certified Professional Midwife may accept a client for a vaginal delivery:

1. After prior Cesarean section, or

2. Of afetus in a complete breech or frank breech presentation.

Before providing services to a client, a midwife shall:

1. Inform a client, both orally and in writing, of:

a. The midwife's scope of practice, educational background, and credentials:
b. If applicable to the client’s condition, the midwife’s experience with:

i. Vaginal birth after prior Cesarean section delivery, or

ii. Delivery of a fetus in a complete breech or frank breech presentation;

c. The potential risks; adverse outcomes; neonatal or maternal complications. including death; and alternatives
associated with an at-home delivery specific to the client’s condition, including the conditions described in sub-
section (C)(1)(b):

d. The requirement for tests specified in subsections (1) and (K)(4)(c). and the potential risks for declining a test,

and. if a test is declined. the need for a written assertion of a client’s decision to decline testing;
e. The requirement for consultation for a condition specified in R9-16-112; and
The requirement for the transfer of care for a condition specified in R9-16-111; and

2. Obtam a written informed consent for midwifery services according to R9-16-109.

A midwife shall establish an emergency care plan for the client that includes:

1. The name, address, and phone number of:
a. The hospital closest to the birthing location that provides obstetrical services, and
b. An emergency medical services provider that provides service between the birthing location and the hospital

identified in subsection (D)(1)(a):

2. The hospital identified in subsection (D)(1)(a) is within 25 miles of the birthing location for a delivery identified in
subsection (B):;

3. The signature of the client and the date signed:; and

4. The signature of the midwife and the date signed.

A midwife shall ensure the client receives a copy of the emergency care plan required in subsection (D).
A midwife shall implement the emergency care plan by immediately calling the emergency medical services provider

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1828 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

identified in subsection (D)(1)(b) for any condition that threatens the life of the client or the client’s child.

G. A midwife shall maintain all instruments used for delivery in an aseptic manner and other birthing equipment and supplies
in clean and good condition.
H. A midwife shall assess a client's physical condition in order to establish the client's continuing eligibility to receive mid-
wifery services.
L. During the prenatal period, the midwife shall:
1. Until October 1, 2013, schedule or arrange for the following tests for the client within 28 weeks gestation:
a. Blood type, including ABO and Rh, with antibody screen;
b. Urinalysis;
c. HIV:
d. Hepatitis B;
e. Hepatitis C;
f.  Syphilis as required in A.R.S. 8§ 36-693;
9. Rubella titer;
h. Chlamydia; and
i. Gonorrhea;
2. Until October 1, 2013, schedule or arrange for the following tests for the client:
a. A Dblood glucose screening test for diabetes completed between 24 and 28 weeks of gestation;
b. A hematocrit and hemoglobin or complete blood count test completed between 28 and 36 weeks of gestation;
c. Avaginal-rectal swab for Group B Strep Streptococcus culture completed between 35 and 37 weeks of gestation;
d. At least one ultrasound and recommended follow-up testing to determine placental location and risk for placenta
previa and placenta accrete; and
e. An ultrasound at 36-37 weeks gestation to confirm fetal presentation and estimated fetal weight for a breech
pregnancy;

3. As of October 1, 2013, except as provided in R9-16-110, ensure that the tests in section (1)(1) are completed by the
client within 28 weeks gestation:

4. As of October 1, 2013, except as provided in R9-16-110, ensure that the tests in subsection (1)(2) are completed by
the client;

5. Conduct a prenatal visit at least once every 4 weeks until the beginning of 28 weeks of gestation, once every 2 weeks
from the beginning of 28 weeks until the end of 36 weeks of gestation, and once a week after 36 weeks of gestation
that includes:

a. Taking the client’s weight, urinalysis for protein. nitrites. glucose and ketones; blood pressure; and assessment of
the lower extremities for swelling:

b. Measurement of the fundal height and listening for fetal heart tones and, later in the pregnancy. feeling the abdo-
men to determine the position of the fetus;

c. Documentation of fetal movement beginning at 28 weeks of gestation;

d. Document of:
i. The occurrence of bleeding or invasive uterine procedures, and
ii. Any medications taken during the pregnancy that are specific to the needs of an Rh negative client;

e. Referral of a client for lab tests or other assessments, if applicable, based upon examination or history; and

f. Recommendation of administration of the drug RhoGam to unsensitized Rh negative mothers after 28 weeks, or
any time bleeding or invasive uterine procedures are done, or midwife administration of RhoGam under a physi-
cian's written orders;

6. Monitor fetal heart tones with fetoscope and document the client’s report of first quickening. between 18 and 20
weeks of gestation;

7. Conduct weekly visits until signs of first quickening have occurred if first quickening has not been reported by 20
weeks of gestation;

8. Initiate a consultation if first quickening has not occurred by the end of 22 weeks of gestation; and

9. Conduct a prenatal visit of the birthing location before the end of 35 weeks of gestation to ensure that the birthing
environment is appropriate for birth and that communication is available to the hospital and emergency medical ser-
vices provider identified in subsection(D)(1).

J. During the intrapartum period. a midwife shall:

1. Determine if the client is in labor and the appropriate course of action to be taken by:

a. Assessing the interval, duration, intensity, location, and pattern of the contractions;

b. Determining the condition of the membranes, whether intact or ruptured, and the amount and color of fluid;

c. Reviewing with the client the need for an adequate fluid intake, relaxation, activity, and emergency management;
and

d. Deciding whether to go to client's home, remain in telephone contact, or arrange for transfer of care or consulta-
tion;

July 19, 2013 Page 1829 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

N>

|«

[~

|

6

=

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Contact the hospital identified in subsection (D)(1)(a) according to the policies and procedures established by the

hospital regarding communication with midwives when the client begins labor and ends labor;

During labor, assess the condition of the client and fetus upon initial contact, every half hour in active labor until

completely dilated, and every 15 to 20 minutes during pushing, following rupture of the amniotic bag, or until the

newborn is delivered, including:

a. Initial physical assessment and checking of vital signs every 2 to 4 hours of the client;

b. Assessing fetal heart tones every 30 minutes in active first stage labor, and every 15 minutes during second stage,
following rupture of the amniotic bag. or with any significant change in labor patterns;

c. Periodically assessing contractions, fetal presentation. dilation, effacement, and fetal position by vaginal exam-
ination;

d. Maintaining proper fluid balance for the client throughout labor as determined by urinary output and monitoring
urine for presence of ketones; and

e. Assisting in support and comfort measures to the client and family:;

For deliveries described in subsection (B). during labor determine:

a. For primiparas, the progress of active labor by monitoring whether dilation occurs at an average of 1 centimeter
per hour until completely dilated. and a second stage does not exceed 2 hours, if applicable:;

b. Normal progress of active labor for multigravidas by monitoring whether dilation occurs at an average of 1.5 to 2
centimeters per hour until completely dilated, and a second stage does not exceed 1 hour, if applicable: or

c. The progress of active labor according to the Management Guidelines recommended by the American Congress
of Obstetricians and Gynecologists;

After delivery of the newborn:

Assess the newborn at 1 minute and 5 minutes to determine the Apgar scores;

Physically assess the newborn for any abnormalities:

Inspect the client's perineum, vagina, and cervix for lacerations;

Deliver the placenta within 1 hour and assess the client for signs of separation, frank or occult bleeding; and

Examine the placenta for intactness and to determine the number of umbilical cord vessels; and

Recognize and respond to any situation requiring immediate intervention.

[® =210 [T |

Burinq the postpartum period, the midwife shall:

1.

N>

|«

[~

During the 2 hours after delivery of the placenta. provide the following care to the client:

a. Every 15 to 20 minutes for the first hour and every 30 minutes for the second hour:
i. Take vital signs of the client,

ii. Perform external massage of the uterus, and

iii. Evaluate bleeding:

Assist the client to urinate within 2 hours following the birth, if applicable:

Evaluate the perineum, vagina. and cervix for tears, bleeding. or blood clots:

Assist with maternal newborn and infant bonding:

Assist with initial breast feeding. instructing the client in the care of the breast, and reviewing potential danger

signs, if appropriate;

Provide instruction to the family about adequate fluid and nutritional intake, rest, and the types of exercise

allowed, normal and abnormal bleeding. bladder and bowel function, appropriate baby care, signs and symptoms

of postpartum depression. and any symptoms that may pose a threat to the health or life of the client or the cli-

ent’s newborn and appropriate emergency phone numbers;

g. Recommend or administer under physician’s written orders, the drug RhoGam to an unsensitized Rh-negative

mother who delivers an Rh-positive newborn. Administration shall occur not later than 72 hours after birth; and

Document any medications taken by the client in the client’s record to an unsensitized Rh-negative client who

delivers an Rh-positive newborn;

During the 2 hours after delivery of the placenta, provide the following care to the newborn:

[P |20 =

[l

a. Perform a newborn physical exam to determine the newborn's gestational age and any abnormalities;

b. Comply with the requirements in A.A.C. R9-6-332;

c. Recommend or administer Vitamin K under physician's written orders to the newborn. Administration shall
occur not later than 72 hours after birth; and

d. Document the administration of any medications or vitamins to the newborn in the newborn’s record according

to the physician’s written orders;
Evaluate the client or newborn for any abnormal or emergency situation and seek consultation or intervention, if
applicable, according to these rules; and
Re-evaluate the condition of the client and newborn between 24 and 72 hours after delivery to determine whether the
recovery is following a normal course, including:
a. Assessing baseline indicators such as the client's vital signs, bowel and bladder function, bleeding, breasts, feed-
ing of the newborn, sleep/rest cycle, activity with any recommendations for change;

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1830 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

[=

Assessing baseline indicators of well-being in the newborn such as vital signs, weight, cry. suck and feeding,
fontanel, sleeping. and bowel and bladder function with documentation of meconium, and providing any recom-
mendations for changes made to the family;
c. Submitting blood obtained from a heel stick to the newborn to the state laboratory for screening according to
A.R.S. § 36-694(B) and 9 A.A.C. 13, Article 2, unless a written refusal is obtained from the client and docu-
mented in the client’s record and the newborn's record; and
d. Recommending to the client that the client secure medical follow-up for her newborn.
L. A midwife shall file a birth certificate with the local registrar within seven calendar days after the birth of the newborn.
M. Subsections (B). (C)(1)(b). (C)(1)(d) and (J)(2) and (4) are effective July 1, 2014.

R9-16-109. Informed Consent for Midwifery Services
A. A midwife shall obtain a written informed consent for midwifery services in a format provided by the Department that
contains:
1. The midwife’s:
Name,
Telephone number,
License number, and
E-mail address;
he client’s:
Name:
Address;
Telephone number;
Date of birth; and
E-mail address, if applicable;
n attestation that the client was:
Provided the information required in R9-10-108(C)(1):
Informed of the emergency care plan as required in R9-10-108(D); and
Given an opportunity to have guestions answered. have an understanding of the information provided, and
choose to continue with midwifery services:; and
4. The signatures of the client and midwife and date signed.
B. A midwife shall ensure that the written informed consent for midwifery services is placed in the client file.
C. A midwife shall ensure that a copy of the written informed consent for midwifery services is provided to the:
1. Client, and
2. Department within five calendar days after a Department request.
D. This section is effective October 1, 2013.

R9-16-110. Assertion to Decline Required Tests
A. Except for R9-16-108(1)(1)(f). if the client declines a test required in R9-16-108(1)(3) and (4). a midwife shall obtain a
written assertion of a client’s decision to decline a required test in a format provided by the Department, that contains:
1. The midwife’s:
Name
Telephone number,
License number, and
E-mail address;
he client’s:
Name:
Address;
Telephone number;
Date of birth; and
E-mail address, if applicable;
The required test being declined by the client;
Additional information as required by the Department;
An attestation that the client:
a.  Was provided the information as required in R9-10-108(C)(1)(d). and
b. Isdeclining testing; and
6. The signatures of the client and midwife and date signed.
A midwife shall ensure that the written assertion of the decision to decline a test is placed in the client file.
A midwife shall ensure that a copy of the written assertion of the decision to decline a test is provided to the:
1. Client, and
2. Department within five calendar days after a Department request.

N>

|«

CERPRRR SR Hee o

|I\>
PP E R Rl E R

o | |

1 IPU

July 19, 2013 Page 1831 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

D. This section is effective October 1, 2013.

R9-16-168- R9-16-111.
A A-hicensed-ridwi

Prohibited Practice; Transfer of Care

m P PP

5

A. A midwife shall not provide midwifery services in a location that has the potential to cause harm to the client or the cli-
ent’s child.
B. A midwife shall not accept for midwifery services or continue midwifery services for a client who has or develops any of
the following:
1. A previous surgery that involved:
a. An incision in the uterus, except as provided in R9-16-108(B)(1); or
b. A previous uterine surgery that enters the myometrium;
2. Multiple fetuses;
3. Placenta previa or placenta accreta;
4. A history of severe postpartum bleeding, of unknown cause, which required transfusion;
5. Deep vein thrombosis or pulmonary embolism;
6. Uncontrolled gestational diabetes:;
7. Insulin-dependent diabetes;
8. Hypertension;
9. Rh disease with positive titers:;
10. Active:

a. Tuberculosis;

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1832 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Syphilis;

Genital herpes at the onset of labor;

Hepatitis until treated and recovered, following which midwifery services may resume; or

e. Gonorrhea until treated and recovered. following which midwifery services may resume;

11. Preeclampsia or eclampsia persisting after the second trimester;

12. A blood pressure of 140/90 or an increase of 30 millimeters of Mercury systolic or 15 millimeters of Mercury dia-
stolic over the client's lowest baseline blood pressure for two consecutive readings taken at least six hours apart;

Q|0 [T

13. A persistent hemoglobin level below 10 grams or a hematocrit below 30 during the third trimester;
14. A pelvis that will not safely allow a baby to pass through during labor;
15. A serious mental illness;
16. Evidence of substance abuse. including six months prior to pregnancy. to one of the following. evident during an
assessment of a client:
a. Alcohol
b. Narcotics, or
c. Other drugs:;
17. Except as provided in R9-16-108(B)(2). a fetus with an abnormal presentation:
18. Labor beginning before the beginning of 36 weeks gestation;
19. A progression of labor that does not meet the requirements of R9-16-108(J)(4). if applicable;
20. Gestational age greater than 34 weeks with no prior prenatal care;
21. A gestation beyond 42 weeks;
22. Presence of ruptured membranes without onset of labor within 24 hours;
23. Abnormal fetal heart rate consistently less than 120 beats per minute or more than 160 beats per minute;
24. Presence of thick meconium, blood-stained amniotic fluid, or abnormal fetal heart tones:
25. A postpartum hemorrhage of greater than 500 milliliters in the current pregnancy; or
26. A non-bleeding placenta retained for more than 60 minutes.
C. A midwife shall not perform a vaginal delivery after prior Cesarean section for a client who:
1. Had:
a. More than one previous Cesarean section;
b. A previous Cesarean section:
i. With a classical, vertical, or unknown uterine incision;
ii. Within 18 months before the expected delivery;
iii. With complications, including uterine infection; or
iv. Due to failure to progress as a result of cephalopelvic insufficiency; or
c. Complications during a previous vaginal delivery after a Cesarean section; or
2. Has a fetus:
a.  With fetal anomalies, confirmed by an ultrasound; or
b. Ina breech presentation.
D. A midwife shall not perform a vaginal delivery of a fetus in a breech presentation for a client who:
1. Had aprevious:
a. Unsuccessful vaginal delivery or other demonstration of an inadequate maternal pelvis, or
b. Cesarean section; or
2. Has a fetus:
a.  With fetal anomalies, confirmed by an ultrasound:
b. With an estimated fetal weight less than 2500 grams or more than 3800 grams; or
c. Inanincomplete breech presentation.
E. If the client has any of the conditions in subsections (B) through (D), a midwife shall:
1. Document the condition in the client record, and
2. [Initiate transfer of care.
E. A midwife shall not perform any operative procedures except as provided in R9-16-113.
G. A midwife shall not:
1. Use any artificial, forcible, or mechanical means to assist birth:; or
2. Attempt to correct fetal presentations by external or internal movement of the fetus.
H. A midwife shall not administer drugs or medications except as provided in R9-16-108(1)(5)(f). (K)(1)(q). (K)(2)(c). or

R9-16-113.

Except as provided in R9-16-113, a midwife shall:

1. Discontinue midwifery services and transfer care of a newborn in which any of the following conditions are present:
a. Birth weight less than 2000 grams;
b. Pale, blue, or gray color after 10 minutes;
c. [Excessive edema;

July 19, 2013 Page 1833 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

d. Major congenital anomalies: or
e. Respiratory distress; and
2. Document the condition in subsection (1)(1) in the newborn record.

RO16H2.  Expired
RO-16-109- R9-16-112. Required Consultation

BEEEPP NPopPpE

A. A midwife shall obtain a consultation at the time a client is determined to have any of the following during the current
pregnancy:
1. A positive culture for Group B Streptococcus;
2. History of seizure disorder;
3. History of stillbirth, premature labor, or parity greater than 5;
4. Aqge younger than 16 years;
5. A primigravida older than 40 years of age:
6. Failure to auscultate fetal heart tones by the beginning of 22 weeks gestation;
7. Failure to gain 12 pounds by the beginning of 30 weeks gestation or gaining more than 8 pounds in any two-week

period during pregnancy:
Greater than 1+ sugar, ketones, or protein in the urine on two consecutive Visits;

|

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1834 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

|

1o

D.

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Excessive vomiting or continued vomiting after the end of 20 weeks gestation;

Symptoms of decreased fetal movement;

A fever of 100.4° F or 38° C or greater measured twice at 24 hours apart;

Tender uterine fundus;

Effacement or dilation of the cervix. greater than a fingertip. accompanied by contractions, prior to the beginning of
36 weeks gestation;

Measurements for fetal growth that are not within 2 centimeters of the gestational age;

Second degree or greater lacerations of the birth canal;

Except as provided in R9-16-111(A)(20), an abnormal progression of labor;

An unengaged head at 7 centimeters dilation in active labor;

Eailure of the uterus to return to normal size in the current postpartum period;

Persistent shortness of breath requiring more than 24 breaths per minute, or breathing which is difficult or painful;
Gonorrhea;

Chlamydia;

Syphilis;

Heart disease;

Kidney disease;

Blood disease; or

A positive test result for:

= = 2 = o
w N = o

NN NININININ -
BRRBRRBEREERER

a. HIv,
b. Hepatitis B, or
C. Hepatitis C.
A midwife shall obtain a consultation at the time a newborn demonstrates any of the following conditions:
1. Weight less than 2500 grams or 5 pounds, 8 ounces:
2. Congenital anomalies;
3. An Apagar score less than 7 at 5 minutes;
4. Persistent breathing at a rate of more than 60 breaths per minute;
5. An.irreqular heartbeat;
6. Persistent poor muscle tone;
7. Less than 36 weeks gestation or greater than 42 weeks gestation by gestational exam;
8. Yellowish-colored skin within 48 hours;
9. Abnormal crying;
10. Meconium staining of the skin:
11. Lethargy;
12. Irritability;
13. Poor feeding;
14. Excessively pink coloring over the entire body;
15. Failure to urinate or pass meconium in the first 24 hours of life;
16. A hip examination which results in a clicking or incorrect angle;
17. Skin rashes not commonly seen in the newborn; or
18. Temperature persistently above 99.0° or below 97.6° F.

The midwife shall inform the client of the consultation required in subsections (A) or (B) and recommendations of the
physician or certified nurse midwife.
The midwife shall document the consultation required in subsections (A) or (B) and recommendations received in the cli-

ent record or newborn record.

July 19, 2013 Page 1835 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

A. Inan emergency situation in which the health or safety of the client or newborn are determined to be at risk, a midwife:

> =

Shall ensure that an emergency medical services provider is called; and
May perform the following procedures as necessary:

a. Cardiopulmonary resuscitation of the client or newborn with a bag and mask:

b. Administration of oxygen at no more than 8 liters per minute via mask for the client and 5 liters per minute for
the newborn via neonatal mask;

c. Episiotomy to expedite the delivery during fetal distress;

d. Suturing of episiotomy or tearing of the perineum to stop active bleeding. following administration of local anes-
thetic, contingent upon consultation with a physician or certified nurse midwife, or physician’s written orders:

e. Release of shoulder dystocia by utilizing:

Hyperflexion of the client's legs to the abdomen,
Application of external pressure suprapubically,
Rotation of the nonimpacted shoulder until the impacted shoulder is released.,
Delivery of the posterior shoulder,
Application of posterior pressure on the anterior shoulder, or
Positioning of the client on all fours with the back arched:;
f. Manual exploration of the uterus for control of severe bleeding; or
Manual removal of placenta.

SIS R

g.
B. A licensed midwife may administer a maximum dose of 20 units of pitocin intramuscularly. in 10-unit dosages each, 30

minutes apart, to a client for the control of postpartum hemorrhage, contingent upon physician or certified nurse midwife

consultation and written orders by a physician, and arrangements for immediate transport of the client to a hospital.

C. A midwife shall document in the client’s record any medications taken by a client for the control of postpartum hemor-

rhage.
R9-16-114. Midwife Report after Termination of Midwifery Services

A. A midwife shall complete a midwife report for each client, in a format provided by the Department, that includes the fol-

lowing:

1.

N>

bl

|

&

The midwife’s:
First name
Last name, and
License number;
he client’s:
Date of birth;
Client number;
Date of last menstrual period:;
Estimated date of delivery:
Gravida (number):
Para (number): and
If applicable, whether the client had a vaginal delivery after prior Cesarean section or vaginal delivery of a fetus
in a complete breech or frank breech presentation:;
A description of the maternal outcome, including any complications:;
If a vaginal delivery after prior Cesarean section or vaginal delivery of a fetus in a complete breech or frank breech
presentation:
Rate of dilation. and
Duration of second stage labor;
applicable, the newborn’s:
Date of birth;
Gender:
Weight;
Length;
Head circumference;
Designation of average, small, or large for gestational age;
Apgar score at 1 minute;
Apgar score at 5 minutes;
Existence of complications;
Description of complications, if applicable;
Birth certificate filing date; and
Birth certificate number, if available;
hether the client required transfer of care and. if applicable:
Method of transport,

el S L =1

[= [

=

RIS REEEe e e o

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1836 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

11.

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

Type of facility or individual to which the midwife transferred care of the client,

Name of destination,

Time arrived at destination,

Confirmation the emergency care plan was utilized, and

Medical reason for transfer of care;

The date midwifery services were terminated;

Reason for the termination of midwifery services;

If termination of midwifery services was due to a medical condition, the specific medical condition;
Whether information was provided on newborn screening; and

Whether newborn screening tests were ordered as required in A.R.S. § 36-694.

=P |20 =

B. The midwife shall submit a midwife report for a client to the Department within 30 calendar days after the termination of
midwifery services to the client.

R—Q—]:é—]:@-?— R9 16 115 Reee%d-keepmg—a-nel—RepeH—Reﬁ#Fememg Cllent and Newborn Records

>
NN e P

|

mldW|fe shall ensure that a record is established and malntalned according to A.R.S. 88 12-2291 and 12-2297 for each:

Client, and

Newborn delivered by the midwife from a client.

midwife shall ensure that a record for each client includes the following:

|© | |N @ o | oo

= =
Fle

The client’s full name, date of birth, address, and client number;
Names, addresses, and telephone numbers of the client's spouse or other individuals designated by the client to be
contacted in an emergency:;
Written informed consent for midwifery services, as required in R9-16-108(C)(2):
Assertion to decline required tests, as required in R9-16-110(A)(3);
A copy of the emergency care plan, as required in R9-16-108(E):
The date the midwife began providing midwifery services to the client;
The date the client is expected to deliver the newborn;
The date the newborn was delivered, if applicable;
An initial assessment of the client to:
a. Determine whether the client has a history of a condition or circumstance that would preclude care of the client
by the midwife, as specified in R9-16-111; and
b. Determine the:
i. Number and outcome of previous pregnancies, and
ii. Number of previous medical or midwife visits the client has had during the current pregnancy:;
Progress notes documenting the midwifery services provided to the client;
For a delivery identified in R9-16-108(B):

July 19, 2013 Page 1837 Volume 19, Issue 29



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State
Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

a. Rate of dilation, and
b. Duration of second stage labor;
12. Laboratory and diagnostic reports, according to R9-16-108(1);
13. Documentation of consultations as required in R9-16-112, including:
a. Reason for the consultation,
b. Name of physician or certified nurse midwife,
c. Date of consultation,
d. Time of consultation, and
e. Recommendation made by the physician or certified nurse midwife:;
14. Written reports received from consultations as required in R9-16-112:
15. A description of any conditions or circumstances arising during the pregnancy that required the transfer of care;
16. The name of the physician, certified nurse midwife, or hospital to which the care of the client was transferred, if
applicable;
17. Documentation of medications or vitamins taken by the client;
18. Documentation of medications or vitamins administered to the client and the physician’s written orders for the medi-
cations or vitamins;
19. The outcome of the pregnancy:
20. The date the midwife stopped providing midwifery services to the client; and
21. Instructions provided to the client before the midwife stopped providing midwifery services to the client.
C. A midwife shall ensure that a record for each newborn includes the following:
1. The full name, date of birth, and address of the newborn’s mother:;
2. The newborn’s:

a. Date of birth
b. Gender

c. Weight at birth,
d. Length at birth, and
e. Apagar scores at 1 minute and 5 minutes after birth;
3. The newborn’s estimated gestational age at birth;
4. Progress notes documenting the midwifery services provided to the newborn;
5. Laboratory and diagnostic reports, as required in R9-16-108(1):
6. Documentation of consultations as required in R9-16-112:
a. Reason for the consultation,
b. Name of physician or certified nurse midwife,
c. Date of consultation,
d. Time of consultation, and
e. Recommendation made by the physician or certified nurse midwife:;
7. Written reports received from consultations as required in R9-16-112:
8. A description of any conditions or circumstances arising during or after the newborn’s birth that required the transfer
of care;
9. The name of the physician, certified nurse midwife, or hospital to which the care of the newborn was transferred, if
applicable;
10. Documentation of medications or vitamins taken by the newborn;
11. Documentation of medications or vitamins administered to the newborn and the physician’s written orders for the
medications or vitamins;
12. Documentation of newborn screening. including when the specimen collection kit, as defined in A.A.C. R9-13-201,

was submitted and results received, as required in R9-16-108(K)(4)(c);
13. The date the midwife stopped providing midwifery services to the newborn; and
4. Instructions provided to the client about the newborn before the midwife stopped providing midwifery services to the

—

newborn.

P EPPE

Volume 19, Issue 29 Page 1838 July 19, 2013



Arizona Administrative Register / Secretary of State

Notices of Exempt Rulemaking

In addition to the grounds specified in A.R.S. 8§ 36-756 and 13-904(E). the Department may deny, suspend. or revoke a

license permanently or for a definite period of time, and may assess a civil penalty for each violation, for any of the following

causes:

1. Practicing under a false name or alias so as to interfere with or obstruct the investigative or requlatory process,

2. Practicing under the influence of drugs or alcohol,

3. Falsification of records.

4. Obtaining any fee for midwifery services by fraud or misrepresentation,

5. Permitting another to use the midwife's license, or

6. Knowingly providing false information to the Department.

R9-16-117. Midwifery Advisory Committee
A. The director of the Department shall establish a midwifery advisory committee consisting of:

1. Four midwives who are licensed according to Title 36, Chapter 6. Article 7 of the Arizona Revised Statutes;

2. One public member who has used or who has significant experience with midwifery services;

3. One physician who is licensed according to Title 32, Chapter 13, of the Arizona Revised Statutes, or one physician
who is licensed according to Title 32, Chapter 17. of the Arizona Revised Statutes, and who has experience in obstet-
rcs;

4. One nurse midwife who is licensed and certified according to Title 32, Chapter 15 of the Arizona Revised Statutes;
and

5. One ex-officio member.

B. Midwifery advisory committee members:

1. Serve at the discretion of the director of the Department,

2. May serve for three-year terms, and

3. Are not eligible for compensation or reimbursement of expenses.

C. The midwifery advisory committee shall, at a minimum. convene annually.
D. The midwifery advisory committee shall be chaired by the director of the Department.
E. The midwifery advisory committee shall:

Examine aggregate data from the midwife reports required in R9-16-114:

Examine any notifications received by the Department required in R9-16-104(B):;

Examine evidence-based research pertaining to the practice of midwifery:;

Develop an annual report on midwifery and home births in this state during the previous fiscal year, including:

a. Ananalysis of the information from subsections (E)(1) and (2).

b. A summary of the information from subsection (E)(3). and

c. Recommendations for changes to the rules in this Article;

Submit a copy of the report required in subsection (E)(4) to the Department on or before November 15 of each year,
beginning in 2015;

Assist in the development of the informed consent for midwifery services according to R9-16-109 by October 1.
2013; and

Assist in the development of the assertion to decline required tests according to R9-16-110 by October 1, 2013.

[0 ™ =

|

@

|~

July 19, 2013 Page 1839 Volume 19, Issue 29



